Comuunity F omily Fr onds ROBINS CITY COUNCIL ‘

|?5_I“_)h_‘ft'l_"! *:-.Dl .: l“v:n". : |- :.J::

-

7:00 - P.M. IN ROBINS CITY HALL

(ONE OR MORE MEMBERS OF THE COUNCIL MAY BE ATTENDING VIA ELECTRONIC DEVICE)

AGENDA:
1.  CALL THE MEETING TO ORDER
2. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE TO THE FLAG
3. RoLLCALL
4.  APPROVAL OF THE AGENDA
5. MAYOR’S REPORT
6.  COUNCIL REPORTS
7.  ENGINEERS REPORT
8. RuUDD SANITATION REQUEST
9.  CITizEN COMMENTS - Agenda Items (limited to 3 minutes each)
10. CrTIZEN COMMENTS - Non-Agenda Items (limited to 3 minutes each)
11. CONSENT AGENDA:

Minutes of the September 12th and September 19th, 2022 Meeting
Financial Report

List of Bills Submitted

Resolution No. 1022-1, Liquor License, Epic Event Center

Resolution No. 1022-2, Pay Req. #1 to Rathje Construction, SE Trunk Sanitary Sewer
Improvements.

P an oR

12.0LD BUSINESS

a. Public Hearing, Chapter 163, Robins Fire Code.

b. First and possible subsequent Reading(s), Ordinance 2213, Robins Fire Code

c. Second and possible subsequent Reading Ordinance No. 2212, All-Terrain Vehicles,
Snowmobiles and Off-Road Utility Vehicles.

13.NEw BUSINESS

a. Resolution No. 1022-3, Solar Powered Flashing Stop Signs
b. Resolution No. 1022-4, Speed Monitors

13. MOTION TO ADJOURN



This Page is
~Intentionally
Blank




Robins

Planning and Zoning Report
September 30, 2022

Permit FullAddress
Number | BeginDate Comment PermitType PartyName # | Street City State | Zip
B22-001 01/28/22 New Home Construction Building Skogman Homes 3119 Windsor Dr.
BC22-001 01/14/22 Bldg 700 Construction Building FC Land, LLC 3230 N. Ctr Pt Rd #700
B22-002 03/23/22 New Home Construction Building Kimberly Jauga 3078 Windsor Dr.
B22-003 03/31/22 New Home Construction Building Academy Homes 465 Dutch Dr.
B
FY2022 Permits Issued
January 7 New
February 13 Homes
March 25
April 23 %0 Ay
s NeW
May 40 80 R Homes
\67
June 43 70 57 W@\
August 36 / \
50 %42 \
September 24 et 3? \
40 2/°%33 3
October 29, .77 \— 2729
30 1252524 26/ F \ 24.25
November ~7 =30
5 b —\17/ N 1518\ 17,
ecember 20 v N T A 2
Total 231 10 7 \ ..5_':“2
0 T T ¥ T T T ] T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T 1
1992 1994 1996 1998 2000 2002 2004 2006 2008 2010 2012 2014 2016 2018 2020 2022




Roﬁls

ROBINS CITY COUNCIL
MINUTES OF THE SEPTEMBER 12™, 2022 MEETING

Mayor Hinz called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m. on Monday, September 12t, 2022 in the

Robins City Hall. After the Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag, roll call was taken with Councilors
Marilyn Cook, Dick Pilcher, Roger Overbeck, Dave Franzman and JD Smith present along with
Planning and Zoning Administrator Dean Helander, Engineer Dax Suntken, Attorney Holly Corkery,
Deputy Clerk Lisa Goodin, Building Official/Public Works Superintendent Mike Kortenkamp, Police
Chief Andy Humphrey, City Clerk/Treasurer Lori Pickart and 4 guests. Franzman moved to approve
the Agenda, Smith seconded and all voted aye.

COMMITTEE REPORTS

4

Mayor Hinz provided information to the Councilors relating to the upcoming Annual League
of Cities Conference to be held in Waterloo on September 28-30th. He also noted there will
be a council meeting on September 19t, 5:30 p.m. to discuss the Robins Fire Code along
with the West Main Street Reconstruction.

Finance Coordinator Marilyn Cook noted we are in the third month of FY '23 and a budget
amendment follows on the agenda.

Safety Coordinator Dick Pilcher reported there have been several meetings relating to the
UTV Ordinance following on the agenda, along with the Robins Fire Code to be discussed
next week.

Public Works Coordinator Roger Overbeck noted the SE Trunk Sanitary Sewer project is
progressing well and asked if there has been any response from C&N Railroad relating to
the drainage issues, of which there have been none.

Parks Coordinator Dave Franzman noted the Civic Club is wanting to make a donation to the
parks department with some ideas of adding more security cameras, repairing the volley
ball courts or building a small pavilion at South Troy Park.

Streets Coordinator JD Smith noted the city is awaiting calls from contractors relating to
street maintenance. '

Engineer Dax Suntken noted he is working on trying to find a solution for the Quass Road
ditch drainage problem along with working on East Main Street cracks as the maintenance
bond will be ending soon.

CITIZEN COMMENTS — AGENDA ITEMS

<+

Nate Zirbel, of Toddville thanked the Council for allowing UTVs in Robins, however they
cannot legally get into Robins as all of the entry roads have speed limits over 35 mph which
the Iowa Code limits UTVs to roads 35 mph or less. Mayor Hinz commented he feels this is
pretty much a work in progress both at the State and City levels.

Crr1ZEN COMMENTS — NON-AGENDA ITEMS

*

None

CONSENT AGENDA

4

Smith moved to approve the Consent Agenda which contained the Minutes of the August 155,
2022 meeting; the Financial Report; the List of Bills Submitted; Resolution No. 0922-3
approving the street light installation in the Cambridge Heights Second Addition to Robins;
and Resolution No. 0922-6, approving Pay Request #6 to Boomerang Corp for work done on
the Kings Way Watermain Extension. Franzman seconded the motion and all voted aye.



Minutes of the September 12, 2022 City Council Meeting

NEW BUSINESS

a.

FY’23 Budget Amendment, Public Hearing. Mayor Hinz opened the public hearing at 7:17
p.m. Pickart noted the amendment includes expense increases of $18K for the police
department for additional speed signs; $300K for engineering fees to design the West Main
Street Reconstruction and Trail project; and $10K for recodification of the Municipal Code.
The public hearing closed at 7:19 p.m.

Budget Amendment Resolution. Cook moved to approve Resolution No. 0922-2 approving
the FY’23 Budget Amendment, Pilcher seconded and all voted aye.

UTV Public Hearing. Mayor Hinz opened a public hearing at 7:19 p.m. to hear comments and
concerns relating to proposed changes to Chapter 75, All-Terrain Vehicles, Snowmobiles
and Off-Road Utility Vehicles. He explained the state actions relating to UTVs along with the
meetings between himself and public safety officials who created the changes in proposed
Ordinance No. 2212. Al Nickerboecker, 3245 Lakeview Drive in Toddville asked the council
how they are supposed to get into Robins as all of the incoming streets have speed limits
over 35 mph. Pilcher noted the code is specific to Robins and not how to get into town.
Mayor Hinz reiterated he feels this code on the state level is in the early stages and to work
with the state legislators to get amendments made. It was noted the DNR permits are
received from Linn County. The public hearing closed at 7:39.

Ordinance No. 2212. Pilcher moved to approve the First Reading of Ordinance No. 2212
amending Chapter 75 of the Robins Municipal Code relating to All-Terrain Vehicles,
Snowmobiles and Off-Road Utility Vehicles, Franzman seconded and all voted aye.

FY’22 Street Finance Report. Pickart reviewed the FY '22 Street Finance Report with the
Council. Smith moved to approve Resolution No. 0922-1 approving the report, Overbeck
seconded and all voted aye.

Rose Third Addition. Pickart noted the owner of 3586 Alice Road located in Linn County
wants to split off 4.68 acres of their 20 acre property to allow construction of an additional
home. She noted the property lies within two miles of Robins so the city gets a courtesy
review to voice any concerns. Overbeck moved to approve Resolution No. 0922-4, Pilcher
seconded and all voted aye.

Police Chief Salary. Mayor Hinz noted Police Chief Andy Humphrey retired from the Linn
County Sheriff's Department and became Robins’ first full time Police Chief after serving
since 2000 as the part time chief. At the time Andy was appointed Police Chief the IPERS
regulations limited earnings to $30,000 per year. In 2022, IPERS increased the wage ceiling
to $50,000. This resolution would raise the chief's salary to $50,000 in 2022. Pilcher
moved to approve Resolution No. 0922-7 increasing the wages for the full time police chief,
Franzman seconded and all voted aye.

Baker Annexation Request. Pickart noted Fred and Gloria Baker of 3164 Quass Road in Linn
County have requested to annex their property into the city. The Baker's would like to
subdivide their property to allow construction of an additional home. Franzman moved to
approve the Baker's request, Smith seconded and all voted aye.

Leaf Pickup Contract. Pickart noted this fall is the last year of the current leaf pickup
contract with Jordan’s Property Management and has indicated he would be interested in a
5-year contract at an hourly rate at $115 per hour (includes equipment cost). Pilcher
moved to approve the contract with Jordan's Property Management at $115 /hour, Cook
seconded and all voted aye.

OLD BUSINESS

a.

Chapter 155, Building Code. Overbeck moved to approve the Final Reading of Ordinance No.
2208, amending Chapter 155, Building Code of the Robins Municipal Code, Smith seconded
and all voted aye.

Page 2 of 3



Minutes of the September 12, 2022 City Council Meeting

b. Chapter 154, Mechanical Code. Pilcher moved to approve the Final Reading of Ordinance
No. 2209 amending Chapter 154, Mechanical Code of the Robins Municipal Code, Cook
seconded and all voted aye.

c. Chapter 153, Plumbing Code. Franzman moved to approve the Final Reading of Ordinance
No. 2210 amending Chapter 153, Plumbing Code of the Robins Municipal Code, Smith
seconded and all voted aye.

d. Chapter 161, Property Maintenance Code. Cook moved to approve the Final Reading of
Ordinance No. 2210, amending Chapter 161, Property Maintenance Code of the Robins
Municipal Code, Overbeck seconded and all voted aye.

e. Kings Way Watermain Loop. Franzman moved to approve Resolution No. 0922-5 accepting
the Kings Way Watermain Loop, Pilcher seconded and all voted aye.

Smith moved to adjourn at 7:57 p.m., Franzman seconded and all voted aye.

Chuck Hinz, Mayor
ATTEST:

Lori Pickart, City Clerk/Treasurer

Page 3 of 3



Robins

Cormuniiy Famil, Fricnds

CITY OF ROBINS
MINUTES OF THE SEPTEMBER 19™", 2022 MEETING

Mayor Pro-tem Roger Overbeck called the meeting to order at 5:32 p.m. in the Robins City Hall
on Monday, August 19", 2022. After the pledge of Allegiance to the Flag, roll call was taken with
Councilors Roger Overbeck, Marilyn Cook, Dick Pilcher, and Dave Franzman present along with
Attorney Eric Martin, Engineer Kelli Scott, Planning and Zoning Administrator Dean Helander, Deputy
Clerk Lisa Goodin, Building Official/Public Works Superintendent Mike Kortenkamp, Officer Jim Dunn,
and City Clerk/Treasurer Lori Pickart. Franzman moved to approve the Agenda, Cook seconded and all
voted aye.

CONSENT AGENDA

Pilcher moved to approve the Consent Agenda which included Resolution No. 0922-8 approving the
FY22 Urban Renewal Report and Resolution No. 0922-9 awarding the quotation relating to the asphalt
sealant overlay of the East Knoll Park parking lot. Cook seconded the motion and all voted aye.

OLD BUSINESS

a. Fire Code. The Council reviewed Ordinance No. 2213, Chapter 163, Fire Code. The public
hearing and first reading will occur at the October 3" meeting.

b. West Main Street Sewer. The Council reviewed the survey results received from the eight
property owners affected. 3 out of the 8 would like to have city sewer, one just installed a new
septic system, two would like it, but not right away, the remaining two had no interest it in. The
cost for the project is estimated at $406K. The Council felt the cost for three interested parties
was not justifiable.

c. Resolution of Necessity. Resolution No. 0922-10, Resolution of Necessity relating to the West
Main Street Sewer Extension died due to lack of a motion. ‘

Pilcher moved to adjourn at 6:17 p.m., Cook seconded and all voted aye.

Chuck Hinz, Mayor
ATTEST:

Lori Pickart, City Clerk/Treasurer



City of Robins Financial Report October 1, 2022
o
obins
[ BALANCE SEPTEMBER SEPTEMBER BALANCE PROPOSED ANTICIPATED
ACCOUNT: 91/22 RECEIPTS EXPENSES 9/30/22 BILLS BALANCE
GENERAL FUND $2,043,120.61 $145,627.17 $114,552.09 $2,074,195.69 $89,233.26 $1,984,962.43
ROAD USE $835,244.12 $52,584.45 $36,791.95 $851,036.62 $19,809.34 $831,227.28
ROBINS BASEBALL $13,468.34 $0.00 $0.00 $13,468.34 $0.00 $13,468.34
LOCAL OPTION TAX $1,764,819.29 $0.00 $8,941.16 $1,755,878.13 $0.00 $1,755,878.13
TIF $63,381.50 $84,860.26 $0.00 $148,241.76 $0.00 $148,241.76
DEBT SERVICE $18,141.77 $28,307.53 $0.00 $46,449.30 $0.00 $46,449.30
CAPITAL PROJECTS $2,623,464.79 $0.00 $728.00 $2,622,736.79 $16,016.22 $2,606,720.57
WATER UTILITY $204,947.01 $3,900.00 $1,059.52 $207,787.49 $724.51 $207,062.98
SEWER UTILITY $586,246.38 $68,886.28 $25,525.94 $629,606.72 $27,319.00 $602,287.72
TOTALS $8,152,833.81 $384,165.69 $187,598.66 $8,349,400.84 $153,102.33 $8,196,298.51
September Receipts Police Fines $24.00
Vehicle Inspections $360.00
American Relief Plan $0.00
Park Rental $600.00
Golf Cart License $0.00
Ball Diamond Usage $25.00
City Hall Rental $250.00
Building Permits $5,203.00
Coseco Permits $0.00
Engineering Services Fee $0.00
Platting Fees $0.00
Misc. Receipts $919.76
Property Taxes $138,245.41
Alcohol Permits $0.00
Road Use Receipts $52,584.45
Local Option Tax Receipts $0.00
TIF Receipts $84,860.26
Debt Service Receipts $28,307.53
Bond Proceeds $0.00
Capital Projects Reimbursements $0.00
Cedar Rapids Water Reimbursement $0.00
Water Main Fees $2,700.00
Woater Connection Fee $1,200.00
Sewer User Fees $68,886.28
System Development Fees $0.00
Total Receipts $384,165.69
Cash and Investment Account Balance as of 9/30/22
Checking Savings CD's Totals
General Fund $408,440.45 $1,665,755.24 $2,074,195.69
Road Use $52,504.67 $798,531.95 $851,036.62
Robins Baseball Inst. $212.67 $13,255.67 $13,468.34
Local Option Tax $34,745.13 $1,721,133.00 $1,755,878.13
TIF $84,954.45 $63,287.31 $148,241.76
Debt Service $28,698.93 $17,750.37 $46,449.30
Capital Projects $559.83 $2,622,176.96 $2,622,736.79
Water Utility $3,580.78 $204,206.71 $207,787.49
Sewer Utility $68,548.97 $561,057.75 $629,606.72
Totals $682,245.88 $7,667,154.96 $0.00 $8,349,400.84




0S'289'F 0S°/89'% IDIAISS a01a13G dndeg SuaIA
61'8C 61°8C syred romoux 100pINQ AeMPIN
L1°G6 L9LL ¢eae 60'1¢ 60°IC sed rermjeu UedLIDUTY-PIAL
£9°6¥ €9'6% puadns suoyd Aren) qrequen
00'168 ‘ 00168 s99§ Aouzoyye DT1 ‘sefreq YU
€0°S¥e ¥e'84C  |867CC | 7433 sorddns Samo]
£9'£20°C L6729 |6V Ty 12086 Apinoss D Auno) uury]
00°18¢ 00°18€ Jred MH ¥ punol 1O do-0) uur]
TTIL09L  |TT 910791 Pd HD-sAemaarip Speoy "99g ‘0D uur]
cC1se TC16E 1ordod dnoioy 2030 Yoo
06'96€ 06'96€ SuLIOjIum ha S
°L€9 y1Laq 858 safddns suaswI 1, /2139 uyof
12942 12942 sudisjoams|  sSLOSMPU] UOSLIJ BMO]
9’67 £€9°6¥ puadns auoyd Apuy ‘Aaxydumyy
09°04C 09°04C sariddns joda(] swory
00709 00709 puadns sed SomyD) ‘zurf]
05001 05001 puadns sed uea(] “IPpueRH
00°9%¥% 00'9%% JUSWD XTI Apeay a4Aamer]
£9°6% £9°6¥ puadgs suoyd BSI] “UTPOOD)
19°91¢ 19°91¢ suoryesrqnd apazen
00°0¢ 00°0¢ puadns sed 2AR(] ‘UBLIZURL]
£9'6V £9'6¥ puadns suoyd Iy ‘dureyprag
66208 G6°40S sarfiddns juSpIAg
STY6LYT 000529 |00°00S’Z _|ST¥6CT 007000 {00°0S4°€ yuswided 3/1 oueInsu] HINH
€07 €607 odeqres seM PHOS D'1/¥D
95'64 95°6. sedofoaus syyzomAdoD
00°0€ 00°0¢ puadns se3 UATIrejy 00D
097248 0092 0092 0S°0% 0S5 0¥ 0S#¥L I2Mas surqoy Jo A1)
00°0¢L 00°0¢T 20IAISS|  Suewni] AJ[[EA IEpaD)
0076€°GL 00F6£'ST IoM3s sanmmn ¥/D
00'S19 00°G19 sorddns 010 sIpNg
00°0¢ 00°0¢ S0IAIDS sugig wooeueg
G8°LGE G896 I0IIT {666V serjddns uozewry
19'611°C $0°'1¢ 90'TEL _ |ES6¥L 1T°€cT TOI6ST  |€€69€  |€€66E€  |60°G8C Ao AS1aug querny
416991 L1699 SJIAIDS 211 SIXIIY
201, ?MMMMMMQH ”Mma%»u MMMM asp peoy | vd ) WMMHWU ama aiod syIeg uondinsaq IOpUd A
20T T 1390120 paRIUgNS SIItd surqoy Jo A1)




98°008 98°008 Ispy3yaILy 1219 ‘Usyes]-[0ike]
00°80S 00°80S TP 3yoIL] joue( ‘usyea]-lo1heJ
€298 €298 I0[IDUNOD) al ‘prus-forde
V1K VI wy3yany| uopueig ‘sS3eg-oide]
06151 0616L 1)y 3yaIL] | [9eyoIA Yeor[pag-fo1de
Wl Wl IopySyoIL] yso[ ‘pmid-florde
60°THL'L 6690 |IS19¥ 11829 8F'S6E | SMted/1omag/seang|  pouusy] ‘sPOJ-[loiked
$9'12C $9'12C 1oounod|  preydny ‘IYdg-o1de]
¥STTLY ¥SHILY 12Insed1] /I8 AND 107 ‘JredId-[oide]
TS98% 75°98¥ IO 20 d ], ‘sudeJ-fjoikeg
$9'1C ¥9'12C 1o[puno))| 1980y MoeqieaQ-[o1ded
9L '6L1 9/ 641 190130 SO1Od ouR( ‘PYSO-T[014e]
90'850°C 90°850C I90LJQ 2010| 8915 “UDIDAIDDN-[[0IAe]
9L9TV'L 9L 9L I0gJO 9010 d|  Areo ‘reyuey-joide]
6£TVE 6£TVE 12)y3yeIr]| Lespury ‘zowrerny-[joie]
L1687 6 /AT |96 4P 98'G62'T Tomag /s1eens /Surpimg b ‘dureyusiiod-[joide]
18°€6€ /8°€6€ opydyen|  ueio] ‘uosyp[-oidel
012829 012829 JonyD so10J| Apuy ‘Aemqdumpy-fjorde g
[8°[¥8 9T'/6 16’16 12°0SC 16716 89'91¢  pypreg/smag/speng|  dhmyg ‘eddopy-fjoideg
9%°596 9%°696 1ey3yeryy| enysof ‘puefoH-flo1de ]
0%'89¢ 0%'89¢€ 104ARN yonyD ‘ZurH-flo1deJ
09°T¥6 09°C¥6 zoyensunupy 3unuoz| pjorey] ‘JepueeH-joide]
60°9T1°T 69'69T'L 998 yo1) Anda( esI] ‘urpoosy-o1deJ
¥9°'12¢C ¥9°'1C¢ HOﬂ.—UﬁﬁOU AR ‘ ﬁmENﬁdu..HnﬂOH%mm
0LF8E’T 0L #8E'T yy3yer| yey ‘duepreg-joided
LE08€ £E°08€ 19y 3YoIL] }19q0y ‘994-T[014eJ
96°LEE 96°/E€ 190JO dd10d | ‘uun(-foided
86 L5V 8G'/SV mydgeryy|  piaeq ‘reyeiqg-fioided
1T W zomouno)|  udprepy “jood-[o1deg
6T°L6T 6CL6T JonpoaI] ueLlq ‘sjoog-T[oike]
PT'9SH'F 98°'STT'T 20'TLE 05'89%'T 94048  [goIL]/s1omag /s1oeng| esN ‘uueunysog-oideg
16°LLT 16°'LLT IO 0O 11014 ‘speireg-Toiie g
87706 8V 106 IepySyoa] uose/[ ‘Jy-[lo1de]
9Z'TLL 9z TIL Iopy3yaILy Iouuo)) “Nv-[oiked
00°0€ 00°0¢ puadns sed 1230y H[22qI2A0
€L 6V €L6¥ puadgs suoyd uueunos0g [eSN
Te1oL EMMMW \MS Mﬁﬂ MHHM asnpecd |  V®d i} wawu g arog | sped uopdisaa P,
720 ‘T 1390120 panruqng sqg suIqoy Jo 411D




€CTOL'EST
€ETOL'EST |TTITO9L LS YCL 00°61€°£C |FE608°61 |18956°GC 29°148°€T  [8491€°ST |£0F0T'SL [T0F88'T [e10L
S6'6VL'L L9°eEV ¥9'C¥ 1L969C L0°ELY aurjoses ssaxdxg WSLIM
267079 L¥'888 00°6g 09'2¢ pos dog sarLreng) Surpuspy
/6% /6% puedns suoyd o[ ‘pPlRASISUEA
06'8¥1 LT 66 €9'6¥ souoyd 120 e[nyE)) S
L0°€SE1E 05°8/ 00'9¢T €9°616 62'92€'SL G9TVL 'L Sureaurduy 0SSy % JopAug
00°0¢ 00°0¢€ puadps sed al ‘g
L% 160°T 00°0C1 00°0%¢C 00°09¢ LV LIV S0IAIRS somdwo) yuroJ
00°0¢ 00°0¢ puodns sed DI “TOYO[IJ
€967 €967 puadns suoyd LIOT ‘eI
€2°008 €2°008 a1 urAdy ‘poop-floiked
79'9%S'1 6/89T'T 9T 161 VLT €a'all sIe ] /1omag/s39ans £90f ‘uoyp M-1014e ]
2T LT LT ISNSRIL] qooe[ ‘1aqgqoM-T[0xAeJ
9G"€P0'L 6/'6CC £L°€L8 sjeeng| po[ ‘opeAsisurA-[[o1de]
G0'S0¢ G0'G0¢ 1Ry 3YDILI [OIRUY ‘9sI9purA-To1de]
eoL _cwwwu_w \MS M“M,w Mﬁm asn peoy va3d ) Nwwwu a1y 221104 syreq vopdgosag 10pURA
220T ‘T 13q0100 papruuqns Syyrg suiqoy jo A1)




940 | abed

L6 00¥%'T 8Z% 10T LTT 81T Z6 9JUBINSU] YI[edH
£66 01S'T JATS faat ZET L0T PET axeys A13-SYddl
808 Y21 9T¥ 911 90T 98 80T a1eys A1)-yoId
£0S0T 00091 £6¥'S L2S'T £0%'T YHI'T 6TF'T sapIe[eS dgeuleIq
SYMOM DI'TdNd ‘2
616T¥E 6£0°LLY | OZT'SET 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 6508% | £67°cE | 086'LT | 808'SE | ALAAVS J11dNd TV.LOL
5912 00S‘Z SEE . O0€T 0 . 0 S02Z [00U0) [BWIUY
918%6 9%9°6¥1 0£8%¥S 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 989'TZ | OLO'ST | 886'C | 980°LY €10 341
0009 000'9 0 0 0 0 0 Iy
9ST 00S ¥re 0 0 0 ¥hE juswdmbg Jolep
048'T 0002 0T 0 0 0T 0 sa11ddng [ed1ps|y
£28'C 000°E LLT 0 0 0 LLT SUOQBZIUNIUI]
88%'Z1L 00002 (A2 000'S L¥¥'C 59 0 aJueansu] [edunpy
809 0S8 ¥e 0S 6L 9 6% SUONEIUNWUIO)
LLZ'Y 0009 £2LT 61F Shb £5¥ 90% samn
716'9 0016 88T'C 699'T L8 Y44 L0Z areday yoniy
10T'T 008'T 669 652 £6 £L2 YL [0 % SeH
61T T#STT LVE'6 112 0£0'8 6¥1 156 SJUERUSIUIR| UONEIS
0SE'¥ 00¥%% 0S 0 0S 0 0 Suiures, [e2IpS
006 006 0 0 0 0 0 suurel], 2.1y
009 009 0 0 0 0 0 sdiys1aquis|{/senq
STH'C 009°€ SST'T 89¢ SET ST L¥E PourINSU] YIEIH
61ET 000Z 189 122 871 T1T 122 Saddl
€61°E G5g's 791 956 £0T 68 10T PRI
019'TH 000°0Z 06£'82 ££6Z1 ELET 61T | 062'ET spuadns 3 seLIe[es
JuaunIeda 3L
8£6'¥¥T €68¥VZE SS6'6L 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 €729 | £22'0Z | Z66'%1 | LIS'BT [€10], 3d1[0d
000'ZS 000°ZS 0 0 0 0 0 1e) MON
7£8'C 000°E 89T 89T 0 0 0 F3s0) weidold dalasay
ZSY'E 00Z% 8YL 0 8L 0 0 s3y8r/s1easjoH/suny
SLZ'L 00021 SZLY L08 T06T 0Zg L69'T sarddng "osii
128'E 00S'L 6L9°C SLE'T 9L2'T GSg S.9 axemyjos/Iemnduwo)
001'S 00T'S 0 0 0 0 0 s99] yoredsiq
0052 00SZ 0 0 0 0 0 sedrey) Auno)/siels
£08'8 000'ST £619 0SL'E L¥¥'C 0 0 aoueansu] edpuny
L9%'T 0007 £€S 66 85T 821 8¥T SUONEIUNWLIO)
SLTY 0009 SZL'T ¥ Shb 75¥ 90% sapIn
198% 000'S 6ET 0 6S 8¢ ¥ Jredey aIyLA
€87°E 0009 LIL'T £T¥ 6¥%S 018 S¥6 10 8 SeD
GZSY 000°S SL¥ 0 YL 6¥1 7G7 | soueusiurely Supping
0£6'¥ 000°S 0L 0 0 0L 0 [eAe1]/duturel],
59581 000°SZ SEF9 1¥9'T T%9'T %97 ZIST soueINsyU] PEIY
L9101 00S°€T gee's YLT'T 969 879 S£8 a1eys A1) ‘'SYddl
199°'Z £€60TT E¥'E ISTT YIL 9ZL 1¥8 axeys A1) ‘Yold
12466 000°S¥T 6L5'SH SzZ'ST S1S'6 S.9'%6 | ¥911T saure[es
1uduIlIeda( 33i[0d
|
ALIAVS I11dnd T
aouefeg | 1espng | rewol | ecoun[| gz he | szidy | €ZIeW | €299 | €2 ue[ | zz93d [ ZzZAON ZZP0 | ¢zides | zz8ny | zz Anf zz/62/6
22, Ad suiqoy jo Ao 8y Buryoed] jebpng




90 afieg

65685 | 00098 [ 190'4Z | 86L9 86L'9 86L'9 £99°9 SaLIe[eS|
"urpy 3 Adjod
SIL'8T S18‘€e 00T'S 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9.8T 137 1534 79€'7 | mouno)/ioke &30,
£8¥%1T 0007 L1S 012 0 0 LOE spuadng sen
6%y 00§ 15 £Z 0 0 8z L
€71 SIST 262 £0T 1€ 1€ LZ1 VoId
09S'ST 00861 0¥T% 0¥S'T 00% 00% 006'T salIefes
[Iouno)/ioAe |y
INTWNIIAOY TVHINTD "9
I¥¥'8L ¥ESOTL £60'ZE 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9SL L PES'L 0sZ'8 | €57'8 ['NODI® 'WWOD TVIOL
86L'T 000'Z 202 b 96 29 0 SPIYBA
899'T 00SZ 7£8 0 6¥2 £85 0 sa1jddng s
000°S 000°S 0 0 0 0 0 Sumurel]
20§ 00S 861 0S 0S 6¥ 6¥ SUOPEDIUNIUUIO])
00% 00% 0 0 0 0 0 spuadug/ages[i
VLT 000'ST LSZ'S 0£8 0€8 0£8 L9L 2JuRINSU] Yi[edy
7SS'Y 70L'9 0SIC £¥S [X3 €S 1€S Syddl
81L°E ZEV'S YILT X3 ST¥ £E¥ £T¥ yold
LEOT 0002 £96 10T 0 0 798 s394 Sunas||
£22'8% 000TL LLL'TT A 159°'S 0S.'S 129G SaLIefes
Suwippng/siopadsul/z3d
INAWJOTIATA JINONODT ¥ ALINAWIWOD ‘S
L08ZIT 691°IET Z9€'81 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 £90'% €697 | 601'S | L6%% [JMU%® MNLIND TVIOL
£5% 008 LY 0 0 ¥ 0 0 susis asuenuy A1
00LT 00L1 0 0 0 0 0 0 sjuaay [e1ads
0052 005 0 0 0 0 0 0 A1e1oma)
¥S1'80T 69%9ZT STE8T 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 £90F 9¥9v | 601'S | L6%% [e10L,
000°0S 000°0S 0 0 0 0 0 [[BG2PPId/uaD-THnW
76S°C 00S'% 8061 0Ey LLY 69 LOE sanImn
000°E 000°E 0 0 0 0 0 wWoa3SAS BISWE] YIBed
$T6'LT 000°0¢ 940°C (A2 ¥ 9%E'T VL2 @DURUSIUIE[]
TL0°T 00ST 67F 10T 81T 811 76 8ouEBInSUJ [3[edH
Z06'T 120°S 611T 6¥2 SZE LET 80¢ SdAdl
VST 8¥¥'T 506 102 £92 761 6¥2 Vold
72102 000°ZE 84811 0%9'C 6¥¥'E 7258 197'E SSLIE[eS
Juauneda( syIed
99€£'€6 | 0000ZT | ¥%£99Z | 0 ¥£992 0 0 201A19S ATRIqr]|
NOLLVTHDTY ¥ FYALIND ‘¥
6LY'S¥9 965269 LIT'LY 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 L2007 | ¥68'8 | I8SCI | S9S‘S | SYTIOM JITdnd TVLOL
816'92 00022 28 0Z 0 29 0 91SEM PI[OS
55021 000°€T S¥6 9gS £VE 0 99 SUSIS Suyel],
VLLYT 000°GE 9zZ'01 TLST 69T 9L¥'T S8%'T Sunys 39008
ZELI8S 96SL19 ¥98'SE 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0S6'9T Ls8's | svo'or | ¥10°C €10 S193.41S
0L50T- 04501 04501 0 0 0 [Te1], 1S Ulejy "M
9%0%15 298'82S 918%T ELTY Z£6'E 11L'9 0  |[ewy) 1omag juniy s
00S'Z 00SZ 0 0 0 0 0 syuowaImbay SHAIN
00S'Z 0052 0 0 0 0 0 S0UBUSJUIRI 391,
11595 00009 68¥%€ 162 £L0T 1$8'T 0SZ'T a3eure1q/s8pug
S9%'E 009°E SET 8z 09 9¢ 11 5150) SuImop
ouejeg 198png e10], | czounf | gZzAelW | cerdy | gz e | £2 994 | gzwe[ | 2Z33d | ZZAON ZZW0 | zzades | zzS8ny | zz Am( zz/62/6
Ze A4 suiqoy jo Auo eyl Buijoes ] 186png




9jo ¢ afieq

000°S 000'S 0 0 0 0 0 S8JIAISS Paldenuo)
86082 000'T€ 706'C 16S 881°C 0 €71 [eLI81e | /pPues /3oy
000T 000'T 0 0 0 0 0 Juswdinbyg Joley
£0L'9 00021 £62'S TLe 7671 6¥8'7 088 Jreday 3 s1red
000E 000°S 0 0 0 0 0 Susig oyger],
TLETOT 000°00Z 629'8€ 889'% LST'LT | #8L91 0  jonasuo)/jurely 3991S
004°Z 000°S 00£2 026 192 6111 0. Suneaulsug/[eda]
£50°02 000°0€ L¥6'6 00S'L LY¥'T 0 0 2duE.mMSU]
¥9S'T 00S'Z 9¢6 661 8.2 792 161 SUONEITUNUIUIO])
L¥E'T 00Z'E £58 £¥2 202 S£2 €LY samin
S9T'61 00002 GE8 0 434 502 861 sireday Juawdinby
0LS'S 0002 0SH'E YEY 18LT 609 909 2duBURIIIRI/I0/SED
Z2£2'7€ 000°€E 89/ 0 9L 9¢ 959  hurepy/iredsy Suipying
£00°ST 000°LT L66'E £L6 S90°'T S90°'T Y68 @duRINSU] YI[ESH
81¢'s %208 90L'C 7SS 9¢L YEL $89 aIeys A1) ‘SYddl
6ZE'Y £05'9 11T 0¥y £6S 685 8¥%S a1eys A13 ‘yoId
Y198 000°58 £58'82Z $58'S 816'L €182 8927 S3LIE[RS
I9S[} peoy

1Z096%'T | 6T1°L98'T | 860°TLE 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 S6LTIT | 81698 | £90°S6 | 8TE'ZL | ANNA TVHINTD TV.LOL

SLELIE TI8L'SSY | 90%'8ET 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 098TE | #0272 | L¥T°IS | S6T1°€Z HAAOD TVHINAD TV.IOL
8L1'S6 69.°66 T16SY¥ 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 6SS 0LS 528 LE9T ®10], [IeH A1)
00008 00008 0 0 0 0 0 1S9 /SuIuue]q yainyy)
£9Z'S 00S'y £€7T SgE 90€ T¥E 152 R
981'6 000°0T ¥18 0 79 {244 825 SJUBUSIUIE]Y
022 ST¥ 502 8T 91 12 0ST Sddadl
8.1 PvE 997 ST £1 LT 121 VOId
LZE'T 00S'¥ €L1Z 161 €LT (444 L8S'T Surues) - A1efes
sSwipping /ey &1
Z8¥%'€02 L6T'ZEE | STLBZI 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 SZ¥'6Z | £02°1E | 168%¥ | 961°81 | utmipy 3 451104 [E30],
000°E 000'E 0 0 0 0 0 safi4 azZi[esi|
0SS'T 0008 0S¥9 0 0 5ZZ'S szZ's sspuadunuo) adyj0
865 008 S0z 0 0 S0Z 0 a3e1504
L¥8 000°E £ST1Z 6 £08 0 LEE'T sa1ddng 2SI
806'S 0002 Z60'T 1% 1€Z 9Z¥ ¥ serpddng 8530
000% 000% 0 0 0 0 0 OdN J0pLLIO)
9Z1°01 00021 18T SOT 680'T 00% 082 Buissad014 e1eq
LBE'EY 000°0S €199 168 6TLT £25C 08%'T [EEEN
6S2'SE 000°0¥% TvL'Y ¥62'Z L¥¥'T 0 0 aoueansu] edpuny
98G'€Z- 000°0€ 985°€S 9¢9'cT | %211 [ 60.'82 0 SuLsaurduy
€L6 000°0T £20'6 0¥L'T Y1€'e €L6'E 0 Bupsauiduy 1/y9
166'T 000°S 600°T P11 1€ SEY 671 suoneonqng
SL6'T 00L72 SZL 6£€ 8ST 621 66 SUOHEDMUNWIWO)
00S'T 00ST 0 0 0 0 0 [reusjulely 1omO[ 201D
00002 00002 0 0 0 0 0 Suruue|q d1setens
000'T 0001 0 0 0 0 0 [eael]/3utures],
0Z6'T 000% 080°C 0 0 0 0802 sdiyszequiay/seng
£96'€2 00S'TE LES'L 7261 776'T 726'T TLLT 9duRINSU] YIRIH
£95°S 8118 SSST ¥9 9 9 629 Sdadl
7LSY 6159 £00'T %0S $0S $0S S6¥ FAIE
asuereg 1o8png [el0L czounf | gzhew | czpudy | €zaeW | £€2924 | gzwel | zza9g | ZZAON ZZPV0 | zz1des | zzoay | zz Aml zz/62/6

2% Ad suiqoy jo A0 8yl Bupyoe.] yebpng




gjopabeg

£81°C 61S'E 9gE'T 96€ 0SE 9.2 V1€ a1eys A1) yOId
LSE'8Z 000'9% £¥9°LT 1L22'S 619V 05S9°S L¥TY SaLIe[es
A 1amag
€Z0°0ET 000°%ET LL6S 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 SZL 090°T 0IET 788 [ITILN YA1LVM TV.LOL
000°02 00002 0 0 0 SaAIaSIY WIS J91soog
00098 00098 0 0 0 18d) urejy 181 pang
TRIYI 000°ST 658 6L 782 86¥% 0 A sl ST
7886 000€T 8IT'E 9%9 8LL 718 788 prrnosg uonels dung
Annn v1em
AdAL SSANISNG ‘6
957'85Z°z | 000°S,2'T | ¥¥L9T 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 91091 8Z7L 0 0  woloid reude) e101
000°0SLT | 000°0SLT 0 0 0 0 0 0 19M3G }23.1) UBIpU]
000002 000002 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 "I3)U] 80BLIR, 19MOL
95Z'80€ 000°SZE Y¥L9T 0 0 0 0 97091 8Z. Auno) uury/m ¥H)
sLyafodd TVLIdV) '8
8609Z1°T | 8¥E9Z1T 0SZ 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 ADIAYIS L9490 TV.LOL
056 00Z'T 0SZ 0 0SZ sea4 Suipuog
0 SUBI - 918GY
8¥1'sZ8 8¥1'sz8 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 101
8¥1'sg 8¥1'GE 0 1sa1a3u]
000'06Z 000°06Z 0 ardpuLlg
puog 0Z0Z
000°00€ 00000E 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 [e10L
0 0 0 1Sa123u]
000°00€ 000°00E 0 0 redpuriy
puog 9107
ADIAYAS L9Id "L
SEE'8LY 000°ZLS 886'86 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1¥6'8 | 88Z'IZ | 6589
000°00% 000°00% 0 0 pueT YIed suiqoy
7€' Ia1epA Aepp SBuny
S99°c6- 0 S99°'t6 819'c | 88Z'1Z | 65489 [te1] 1S Ule "M
000'ZLT 0007LT 0 0 a8eIaa( Jomag JuniL S
XV.L NOLLJO V201
00001 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 jusmdmby gy
L88'€T6 | £85S'SSO'T | 969TT1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 9€9'c7 | 7Z6L°9E | £69'8E | TLSTT TVLOL SN avod
THZ'LT %9981 (X4 4" 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 SSg 79¢ 79¢ ¥¥E | 1e10] reaoway mous
006 0017 002 Ly SS SS £F soueinsu] yifeay
61ET 9TH'T 16 Sz ¥z ¥z (24 aIeys A1) ‘SYAdl
690'T 8PI'T 6L 0z 0Z 0Z 61 MouS-yDld
£S6'ET 000'ST L¥0'T £92 £92 £92 857 | se8em [eaoway mous
9$9°9Z6 | 616'9E0'T | E£LZOTL 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 18Z°'€T | 0E¥'9¢ | S€€°8¢€ | LZTTL TV.LOL SLATILS
0S4'8T 05481 0 0 0 0 0 “19s9Yy YnIL Annn 81
000'SZ 000'SZ 0 0 0 0 0 BurreauiSug Y4aN
0SE'EVT 000°0ST 0599 S19 0 S£0'9 0 pays I[es
0012 00T°Z 0 0 0 0 0 1e2q0g Poejdey
10S°0% 10S'0% 0 0 0 0 0 aa19say by 281e]
000°SZ 000°SL 0 0 0 0 0 hIosay yonig Aumn €0
652F6 6526 0 0 0 0 0  patesay z# donn moug
780'LST 780°LST 0 0 0 0 0 soy yona] /duij reade)
aouereg 198png 0] | czounf | szAew | gznady | €ZMe | £€249°4 | gzuel | 2233d | ZZAON ZZWP0 | zz1des | zzany | zz Am[ z22/62/6
2 Ad suiqoy jo Ang sy Buryoel ] yebpng




930 gobed

00S'8T 00052 0059 0 0 005’9 [ £19A003y Sulivaursuy
0S8 000'T 0ST 0 0 0ST SHULIdJ 02350)
9.9'8¢ 00005 ¥ZETT £02'S 9¥%8's SLT syuLIag Suip[ing
00€'S 0007 007 052 0S¥ 0 U9y [1eH 41D
09 09 0 0 0 0 SHED J[09
0 0 0 0 0 0 Uoneuo( JIed
GZ8'T 000°C SLT ] . . : . §2 0ST .0 23es() puowrelq [red
0SET 00S°E 0ST'C 009 000T 0SS [eausy JIed
000°0SZ 000°0SZ 0 0 0 0 spunjay VINHA
0 0 0 0 0 0 puny Ja1[9y uesLIBWY
088'S 0009 0712 09¢ 080T 089 95eA[eS SPIYBA
£¥8 000'T LST ¥z 871 S sauig
ao1od
punyj [eiouon
SANNIATH
6651880 | TLS'SZ9°L | S6Z'LEL 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 968181 | 66598T |¥68°LLT |959°06T HSNAJXI TTV 40 TV.LOL
£19'SSE 1Z5'€9% | 806°L0T 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 ¥ZL67 | 9zs'sz | zeSTZ | 9Z1TE | AMnN 19mas [ej0L
STZ'9€ 7£69E LIL LTL 0 0 0 [RTGTAERED)
7L1'T 00SZ 8z¢ 0 0 8 0Z¢ age1soq
000°E 000°E 0 0 0 0 0 sarjddng a2uj0
18%'ST 00091 61§ 0 0 0 618 Juowdmby
005 00S 0 0 0 0 0 S[eOTWaY)
90£'c2l 82,81 V19 $6€°ST | ¥6E£'ST | #6E'ST | 0¥Z'ST dnyooy ¥D
£80% 00S%¥ (%2 0 Z6 18 0.2 uonenSUpy
00S'T% 00ST¥ 0 0 0 0 0 Fuizisdy) ageA
065 000'T OT¥ 0 0¥ 0 0 Xe], So[eS
6£L'6 00001 192 0 0 192 0 Surseuidug/1esa
TLY'6 000'SZ 9ZS'ST 0529 L¥¥'T 0 628'9 dJueINSu]
000°0S 00005 0 0 0 0 0 uonen[yu|
061°E 0009 0187 ¥SS £85 759 120'T sanImnn
0LLLT 00072 0£Z'E 8.2 08L 08% 69T Tiedey juswdmby
ZLE'S 0002 879'T ST¥ ST¥ ST¥ £8¢ 3dUBINSU] YI[E9H
L19'T VeV $99'T £6¥ 9t S¥E 16€ axeys A1) ‘syddl
adueeg 128png ol | czounf | czAew | gedy | gzdew | £€299d | gzue[ | zz29@ | ZZAON 7700 | zzydes | zzdny | zz Am( z2/62/6

Ze Ad suiqoy Jo Ao 8yl Bunjoel| 1ebpng




9J0 g abeg

9LEQT¥' ¥V | 0ZE91I8% | ¥¥6'L6E 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 99T%8¢ | ZLLIS | 88%'S8 S.LdITDTd TV.LOL
£0Z'%SE 00T'29% | L68°LOT 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 28889 | #¥¥9°c | 99g's¢ |TVLOL ALITLLA YAMAS
0 0 0 0 0 4 yuawdojeaaq wsAS
6T 0 6T% 962 08 £¥ XeJ, So[es
0016 001’6 0 0 0 0 99,] UODIUUO)
€16- 0 €15 87T 81T 192 s394 a1B7
LLG'EVE 000°0S¥ £Z0'90T 91’89 | 768C | 899'%E S99 Jamas
850Z 000 44°) ¥SS 98¢ (00£%-518-019) 3S3193U]
ALTTILA YAMEIS
1Z£8T 00522 6LTY 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 006'€ ¥61 S8  [TV.LOL ALITLLN YALYM
00€ 0087 0021 0021 0 0 a81ey) odid
00021 00071 0 0 0 punjsy ¥d
008% 00S°Z 00LC 004'Z 0 0 a81ey) urey
12T 00S'T 6LZ Y61 S8 (00£+-018-009) 158183}
ALITILN YILYM
000°ZT 00021 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 8 89¢ pAIOYd TV.LIdVI TV.LOL
000ZT 00021 198 89€ DOSY-664-10E) 3s9101U]
S.10A[0dd TV.LIdVD
Z¥10ST SE6'8LT £6L8T 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 80£°8Z 0 S8 ADIAYIS L93d TVLOL
¥1°0S2 SE6'8LT £6L'82 80£'8Z 0 S8% s1diaday 8914198 192
ADIAYIS 199
02Z°88L 96078 9.8'Ss8 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 098'%8 0 9101 TVLOL AIL
0Z2'88L 960'7.8 918'S8 09848 0 9T0°T s1d1eoay A1L[]
A1L
01Z'S8¥% 005'L8% 062°C 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 66ST 169 |LXV.L NOILLJO TVD01
012's 00S'L 062°C 66S'T 169 JOSY-0S6-1Z1)Isa1auu]
000°08% 000°08% 0 0 0 0 syd1e0ayg
XV.L STTVS NOLLdO Tv201
0 0 0 0 SLAIIDTY 1Y
SST¥SY SST9SY | 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 ¥852S | 60Z'¥%E | 08%'SE TV.LOL ASN AVOd
SST'VSH SST%SH 18575 | 60Z%E | 08%'SE sydieoay
asn avou
5219502 | ¥£0'SZZ7C | 606891 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 LZ9'S¥T | S8TIT | L66°TT TV.LOL TVHINTD
Y0£'81ZT | ¥22'6SET | 0Z6'0%1 SYZ'8ET 0 5.9 soxe], Ki1adoad
0 0 0 0 0 0 s1dre03y 194
0SZ 0S. 0 0 0 0 uLa g 817 /1onbry/1sag
0668 000°0T 0T0T 0Z6 S8 S syd1eoay ISIN
1629 000°0T €0LE 9%S'C LST'T DOEF-0Z9-100) 3s9181U]
00SZ 00S°Z 0 0 0 0 $994 durield
aduereqg 198png =0l ccoun[ | gzAel | cziudy | czIep | €z9ad | gzuel | Zzdwa | ZZAON ZZP0 | zzades | zzSny | Zz Amf 22/62/6
Ze A suiqoy Jo Ao eyl Bunjoes] yebpng




RESOLUTION No. 1022-1

RESOLUTION APPROVING APPLICATION FOR CLASS “C” LIQUOR LICENSE,
INCLUDING OUTDOOR SERVICE AND INCLUDING SUNDAY SALES.

WHEREAS, Jerry Sunderman, doing business as Epic Event Center has applied to the City of
Robins for a Class “C” Liquor License, and

WHEREAS, requirements per the State of lowa, and Chapter 120 of the Robins Municipal
Code, regulating the sale of Liquor has been met.

Now THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Robins, lowa, that the Class
“C” Liquor License, for Jerry Sunderman doing business as Epic Event Center, is hereby

approved.

PASSED AND APPROVED, this 3RP day of October 2022.

Chuck Hinz, Mayor

ATTEST:

Lori Pickart, City Clerk



ALCOHCLIC
BEVERAGES
DIVISION

Stalo of lowa

Applicant

NAME OF LEGAL ENTITY

EPIC EVENT CENTER LLC

ADDRESS OF PREMISES

2987 Epic Drive

MAILING ADDRESS

PO Box 887

Contact Person

NAME

Scott Rosekrans

License Information

LICENSE NUMBER

LLC0044653

TENTATIVE EFFECTIVE DATE

Aug 7, 2022

SUB-PERMITS

Class C Liquor License

State of lowa

Alcoholic Beverages Division

NAME OF BUSINESS(DBA)

Epic Event Center

PREMISES SUITE/APT NUMBER

CITY

Marion

PHONE

(319) 361-3713

LICENSE/PERMIT TYPE

Class C Liguor License

BUSINESS

(319) 361-3713

Page 1 of 3

CITY COUNTY ZIP
Robins Linn 52302
STATE ZIP
lowa 52302
EMAIL
scott@epiceventcenter.com
TERM STATUS
12 Month Submitted
to Local
Authority

TENTATIVE EXPIRATION DATE

Aug 6, 2023

LAST DAY OF BUSINESS



ALCOHOLIC
BEVERAGES

DIVISION
Stale of lowa

PRIVILEGES

State of lowa

Alcoholic Beverages Division

Outdoor Service, Sunday Service

Status of Business

BUSINESS TYPE

Limited Liability Company

Ownership

« Individual Owners

Page 2 of 3

NAME CITY STATE | 2IP POSITION % OF OWNERSHIP | U.S. CITIZEN
Scott Rosekrans Robins | lowa 52328 | General Manager | 0.00 Yes
Jami Rosekrans Robins | lowa 52328 | Manager 0.00 Yes
Jerry Sunderman | Robins | lowa 52328 | Owner 50.00 Yes
Karen Sunderman | Robins | lowa 52328 | Owner 50.00 Yes

INSURANCE COMPANY

DRAM CANCEL DATE

West Bend Mutual Insurance
Company

Insurance Company Information

POLICY EFFECTIVE DATE

July 9, 2022

OUTDOOR SERVICE EFFECTIVE

DATE

POLICY EXPIRATION DATE

July 9, 2023

OUTDOOR SERVICE EXPIRATION

DATE



RESOLUTION NO. 1022-2

RESOLUTION APPROVING PAY REQUEST #1 TO
RATHIJE CONSTRUCTION FOR WORK DONE O THE
SE TRUNK SANITARY SEWER IMPROVEMENTS
FROM S. MENTZER TO DRY CREEK

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
ROBINS, IOWA that Pay Request No. 1 to Rathje Construction in the amount of
$122,228.42 for work done on the SE Trunk Sanitary Sewer Improvements from S.
Mentzer to Dry Creek is hereby approved.

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED that the City Clerk is directed to provide
payment for Pay Request No. 1.

PASSED AND APPROVED, this 3™ day of October, 2022.

Chuck Hinz, Maydr
ATTEST:

Lori Pickart, City Clerk/Treasurer



S N Y D E R IOWA | MISSOURI | NEBRASKA | SOUTH DAKOTA | WISCONSIN ”

&ASSOCIATES

September 9, 2022
City of Robins
265 S 2nd St
Robins, TA 52328

RE: SE TRUNK SANITARY SEWER IMPROVEMENTS FROM S. MENTZER TO DRY CREEK —
PAY REQUEST #1

Dear Mayor and City Council,

Enclosed for your review and approval is Pay Request #1 for work on the SE Trunk Sanitary Sewer
Improvements From S. Mentzer to Dry Creek project.

We have reviewed the pay estimate and find it in agreement with the work completed to'date. We,
therefore, recommend approval of Pay Request #1 in the amount of $122,228.42 to Rathje
Construction Company.

Work completed to date includes installation of sanitary sewer, manholes, sanitary sewer
relocation, removal and abandonment of existing sanitary sewer, pavement removal, respreading
of topsoil, erosion control measures, and other miscellaneous construction items.

Feel free to contact me to discuss further if needed. Thank you.

Respectfully,

SNYDER & ASSOCIATES, INC.
Ut /,'/ / M,r’ =

Patrick Williams
Project Engineer

Cc: Nate Byers, Mary Rathje — Rathje Construction Company
Attached: Pay Request #1

T 5005 BOWLING STREET S.W. | SUITE A | CEDAR RAPIDS, IA 52404-5070
p: 319-362-9394 | F: 319-362-9448 | SNYDER-ASSOCIATES.COM
V:\Projects\2021\121.0304.08\Construction\Ltr_2022-09-09_PayApp01.docx



APPLICATION FOR PARTIAL PAYMENT NO. 1

PROJECT: SE Trunk Sanitary Sewer Improvements From S. Mentzer to Dry Creek S&A PROJECT NO.: 121.0304

OWNER: City of Robins
CONTRACTOR: Rathje Construction
ADDRESS: so5z=tirSt -, O .
Marion, 1A §2302
DATE: 9/8/2022

1. CONTRACT SUMMARY:
Original Contract Amount:
Net Change by Change Order:

Contract Amount to Date:

2. WORK SUMMARY:
Total Work Performed to Date:
Retainage: 5%
Total Earned Less Retainage:
Less Previous Applications for Payment:

AMOUNT DUE THIS APPLICATION:

any 408

$ 57897841

$ 616,676.41

$ 128,661.50
$6,433.08

$122,228.42

3. CONTRACTOR'S CERTIFICATION:

The undersigned CONTRACTOR certifies that:

PAYMENT PERIOD: 4/4/2022
to 9/712022

CONTRACT PERIOD: TOTAL CALENDAR DAY¢

$  37,698.00

Criginal Contract Date: September 13, 2021
Original Contract Time: 105
Late Start Date Aprit 1, 2022
Added by Change Order: 84
Contract Time to Date: 9/7/2022
Time Used to Date: 159
Contract Time Remaining: 30

. N

$122,228.42

(1) all previous progress payments received from OWNER on account of Work done under the contract referred to above have been
applied to discharge in full all obligations of CONTRACTOR incurred in connection with the Work covered by prior Applications for

Payment; and

(2) title to all materials and equipment incorporated in said Work or otherwise listed in or covered by the application for Payment are free
and clear of all liens, claims, security interests, and encumbrances

Rathje Construction Company.

CONTRACTOR

4, ENGINEER'S APPROVAL:

onre: - G-Z022.

Payment of the above AMOUNT DUE THIS APPLICATION is recommended:

Snyde; & Associates, Inc.

pate; 9922
5. OWNER'S APPROVAL
City of Robins
OWNER
By DATE:

VA\Projects\20211121,0304,08\Construction\PAY01_SETrunkSanitarySewer.XLSX



6.

DETAILED ESTIMATE OF WORK COMPLETED:

CONTRACT ITEMS COMPLETED WORK COMPLETED WORK
THIS PERIOD TO DATE
ITE T TY. 5 ST
NO'\.'l DESCRIPTION F(’)I:IQN SN LN DO%T 'I?(?TSAL T: DATE] B 'IFC()?I'SATII. TOQSI\TE o 'Iggl' AL
1. |Clearing and Grubbing 1 LS | § 6.450.00]8% 6,450.00 $ o 3 z
2. |Topsoil, On-site, 8" 2264 Cy | 8 16.00 36,224.00 450 3 7,200.00 4.50 $ 7,200.00
3. |Excavation, Class 10 623 Cy 1§ 18.50 11,525.50 $ - $ £
4. |Subbase, Modified 160.7 8Y | 8 6.75 1,084.73 3 = $ -
5. |Removal of Known Pipe Cuivert, CMP, 36" 80 LF | § 15.00 1,200.00 $ - $ =
6. |Removal of Known Pipe Culvert, HDPE, 12" 10 LF [ § 50.00 500.00 $ - 3 -
7. |[Removal of Known Pipe Culvert, RCP, 24" 14 LF [ § 50.00 700.00 16 $ 800.00 16 3 800.00
8. |[Removal of Known Pipe Culvert, RCP, 36" 40 LF | § 25.00 4,000.00 $ - $ =
9. |Compaction Testing 1 LS | $ 1,000.00 1,000.00 3 - $ =
10. |Turfstone Pavers 1384 SY | § 82.00 113,488.00 $ < 3 o
11, [Rock E tion N Cy |8 75.00 2,325.00 3 = $ 2
12, |Trench Foundation 26.5 TON | $ 50,00 1,325,00 $ - $ -
13. {Replacement of Unsuitable Backfill Material 154.6 cYy | 8 30.00 4,638.00 3 - $ =
14. |Trench Campaction Testing 1 LS | % 1,000.00 1,000.00 $ = 3 hd
18. [Sanitary Sewer Gravity Main, Tranched, PVC, 12" 1669.7 LF | 8§ 52.50 87,659.25 3 N $ -
16. iSenitary Sewer Service Relocation 2 EA | $ 1,500.00 3,000.00 1 $ 1,500.00 i $ 1,500.00
17. {Removal of Sanitary Sewer, PVC, 8" a5 LF | & 10.00 350.00 :35 $ 350.00 35 $ 350.00
18. |Removal of Sanitary Sewer, PVC, 10" 692 LF | § 10.00 6,920.00 202 $ 2,920.00 292/ $ 2,920.00
19. Sanitary Sewer Abandonment, Plug 2 EA | 8§ 250.00 500.00 2 $ 500.00 2 3 500.00
20, |Pipe Culvert, Trenched, HDPE, 12" 60 LF | § 53.00 3,180.00 $ . $ -
21, |Pipa Culvert, Trenched, RCP, 24" 14 LF | § 80.76 1,130.50 $ = $ =
22. |Pipe Culvert, Traenched, RCP. 36" 120 LF | & 111.00 13,320.00 $ - $ =)
23. |Pipe Apron, RCP, 24" 1 EA |$ 150000 1,600.00 $ = $ e
24, |Fooling far Concreta Pipe Apron, RCP, 24" 1 EA | § 950.00 950.00 $ - 3 -
25. {Pipa Apron Guard 1 EA | § 165000 1,660.00 $ - $ -
26. |Subdrain, Type 1, Trenched, 6" 592 LF | % 12.75 7,548.00 $ < $ %
27. |Subdrain, Type 1, Trenched, 8" 1870 LF | 8 16.25 32,012.50 $ - $ 3
28. |Subdrain, Type 1, Trenchless, 6" 60 LF | & 80,00 4,800.00 3 - $ -
28. {Subdrain Cleanout, Type A-2, 8" 5 EA | 8 850.00 4,250.00 $ - 3 -
30. |Hickenbottom Subdrain Cleanout, Typs A-2, 8" 5 EA [ $ 700.00 3,500.00 3 - 3 J
31, |Pipe Bursting, HDPE, 16" 401.9 LF | § 135.00 64,258.50 $ £ $ =
32. |Manhole, SW-301, 48" [} EA | $ 3,500.00 21,000.00 5 $ 17,500.00 -5 3 17,500.00
33, |Manhole Adjusiment, Major 2 EA | 8 2,000.00 4,000.00 $ - § -
34, |Connection to Existing Manhole 2 EA | $ 150000 3,000.00 $ - $ -
35, |Remove Manhole 6 EA | $ 1,000.00 6,000.00 2 $ 2,000.00 2 $ 2,000.00
36. _jPavement, HMA 1584 [TON|[$  160.00 25,344.00 $ - $ -
37. {Driveway, Granular 51 TON | 8 25,00 1,275.00 $ - $ -
38. |Pavement Removal 160.9 SY |8 8.75 1,407.88 42 $ 387:50 42 $ 367.50
39. |Temporary Traffic Control 1 LS | $ 300000 3,000.00 $ = $ -
40. |Hydraulic Seeding, Seeding, Fertilizing, and Muiching, Type 1 2.8 AC | & 3,250.00 9,100.00 § - $ o
41, |Hydraulic Seeding, Seeding, Fertilizing, and Mulching, Type 4 28 AC | § 2,500.00 7,000.00 $ - $ -
42, iWatering 300 MGAL| § 45.00 13,500.00 k] = $ =
43. |Warranty 1 LS [§ 500.00 500.00 § - $ =
44. [SWPPP Management 1 LS [$ 1,800.00 1,800.00 § = $ -
45, |Filter Sock, 8" 6983 LF | $ 2.00 13,866.00 5372 $ 10,744.00 5372 5 10,744,00
46, |Filter Socks, Removal 6983 LF |8 0.40 2,793.20 $ - $ =
47. |Temporary RECP, Typs 2.C 5366 SY | $ 1.10 5.802.60 $ E $ 9
48, |Rip Rap, Class E 103 TON | $ 60.00 6,180.00 3 = $ =
49. |Stabilized Construction Entrance 240 SY | § 5.00 1,200.00 156 $ 780.00 156 $ 780.00
50. |Mobilization 1 LS {§ 30,000.00 30,000.00 0.2 $ 6,000.00 0.2] $ 6,000.00
51, |Concrete Washout 1 LS 1§ 500.00 500.00 $ - $ -
15.A |Sanitary Sewer Gravily Main, Trenched, PVC, 12" -1669.7 LF | $ 52.50 {87,659.25 $ & $ E
§2. [Sanitary Sewer Gravity Main, Trenched, PVC, 15" 1669.7 LF |8 60.00 100,182.00 1300] $  78,000.,00 1300 $ 78,000.00
TOTAL ORIGINAL CONTRACT= $ 578,978.41 [TOTAL $ 128,661.50 $ 128,661.50

11121,0304, SomPAY01_SE' itarySewer.XLSX

TOTAL




CHANGE ORDER SUMMARY:

26, {Subdrain, Tybe 1, Trenched, é" -592 LF ‘ 12,75 {7.548.00 $ - | $ -
27. |Subdrain, Type 1, Trenched, 8" g0 | LF 1625 (32,012.50 $ - 5 .
28, Subdrain, Type 1, Trenchless, 6" £0 LF 80,00 {4,800.00 3 - $ =
C02-1 |Subdrain, Type 1, Trenched 12" . 2,562 LF 2425 62,128.50 3 - $. -
CO2-2 |Subdrain, Type 1, Trenchless, 12" 60 LF 240100 14,400.00' $ - 3 -
€02-3 |Remove and Reinstall Rip Rap. 1 LS 1,030.00 1,030.00 $ - 3 -
€024 |Concrete Flume and Sediment Basin Cleanout 1 LS | 4,500.00 4,500.00 $ - $ -
] i i -
TOTAL CHANGE ORDERS = §  7,698.00 $ - $ -
TOTAL CONTRACT
& CHANGE ORDERS $616,676.41 $ 128,661,50 $ 128,661.50

V:AProj 11121,0304.081C PAYQ1_SET)

Y

XLSX




ORDINANCE NO. 2213

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 163 OF THE
ROBINS MUNICIPAL CODE RELATING TO THE FIRE
CODE

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROBINS, IOWA, that
the Municipal Code of the City of Robins, lowa is amended as follows:

SECTION 1. Chapter 163 is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu thereof the
following:

CHAPTER 163
FIRE CODE

163.01 Purpose 163.04 Amendments to Fire Code
163.02  Adoption of the International Fire Code, 163.05 Board of Appeals

2021 Edition
163.03 Inspections

163.01 PURPOSE. The purpose of this chapter is to prescribe regulations governing
conditions hazardous to life and property from fire, hazardous materials, or explosion.

163.02 ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, 2021 EDITION. Pursuantto
public notice and public hearing, there is hereby adopted by the City that certain
code known as the International Fire Code, 2021 Edition, including Appendix B, D, E, F, G,
and], as prepared and edited by the International Code Council, Inc., and the whole
thereof, save and except such portions as are hereafter deleted, modified or
amended; and the same is hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set outin full
herein; and the provisions thereof shall be controlling within the limits of the City
effective December 1, 2022. Appendix C in the International Fire Code, 2021 Edition,
will be used as a reference guide.

163.03 INSPECTIONS. The Fire Code Official is authorized to enter and examine any
building, structure, marine vessel, vehicle or premises in accordance with Section 104.3
of the International Fire Code, 2021 Edition for the purpose of enforcing this code. The
Fire Code Official is authorized to conduct such inspections as are deemed necessary to
determine the extent of compliance with the provisions of this code and to approve
reports of inspection by approved agencies or individuals. Reports of such inspections
shall be prepared and submitted in writing for review and approval. Inspection reports
shall be certified by a responsible officer of such approved agency or by the responsible
individual. The Fire Code Official is authorized to engage such expert opinion as
deemed necessary to report on unusual, detailed or complex technical issues subject to
the approval of the governing body. It shall be the duty of the holder of the permit or
their duly authorized agent to notify the Fire Code Official when work is ready for
inspection. It shall be the duty of the permit holder to provide access to and means for



inspections of such work that are required in the International Fire Code, 2021 Edition.
It shall be the duty of the permit applicant to cause the work to remain visible and able
to be accessed for inspection purposes. Where any installation subject to inspection
prior to use is covered or concealed without having first been inspected, the Fire Code
Official shall have the authority to require that such work be made visible and able to
be accessed for inspection. Neither the Fire Code Official nor the jurisdiction shall be
liable for expense entailed in the removal or replacement of any material required to all
inspection.

163.04 AMENDMENTS TO FIRE CODE. The International Fire Code, 2021 Edition,
first printing, adopted by this chapter, is amended as follows:

1. Delete all of the permits within Section 105.5 Required operational permits
except for the following:

105.5.4 Aviation Facilities
105.5.5 Carnivals and Fairs
105.5.17 Combustible dust-producing operations
105.5.16 Explosives
105.5.29 LP Gas
105.5.34 Open Burning
105.5.42 Pyrotechnic Special Effects Material
105.5.49 Tents and Membrane Structures
2. Delete the exception in Section 105.6.28 and replace with the following:

Exception: A permit is not required for individual containers with a water
capacity oflessthan 100-gallon or multiple container systems having an
aggregate quantity not exceeding 100 gallons, serving occupancies in
group R-3.

3. Delete all of the permits within Section 105.7 - Required construction
permits except for the following:

105.7.1 Automatic Fire-extinguishing Systems
105.7.6 Fire Alarm and Detection System and related equipment
105.7.12 Flammable and Combustible Liquids
105.7.12 LP Gas
4., Delete Section 109.4 - Violation penalties and replace it with the following:

Section 109.4 - Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of
this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who
shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved



5.

10.

11.

L2,

13.

construction documents or direction of the chief code official, or of a

permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be punished

in a manner provided in Chapter 3 of the Code of Ordinances.

Add to Section 113.2 - Schedule of permit fees. Whenever an inspection fee,
re-inspection fee, or permit fee is required, the fees shall be paid as set
forth in the Fire Code Table of Fees (Table 104.12 (A)) as adopted by
resolution.

Delete from Section 202 of Definitions the following:

“Associated with Group E occupancies” and “Accessory to places of religious
worship”.

Delete Section 307.1 - General and replace it with the following:

Section 307.1 - General. A person shall not kindle or maintain or authorize to
be kindled or maintained any open burning unless conducted and

approved in accordance with this section. All recreational fires shall also -

be conducted as required by other governing agencies regulating
emissions.

Delete Section 308.1.4 Exception 3 and replace it with the following:
3. Townhouses as defined by the International Building Code.

Add an exception to Section 315.3.1 - Ceiling Clearance.

Exception: There are no height limitations for storage on shelves against a
fixed wall in non-sprinkled areas of a building.

Amend Table 405.2 by deleting the word “monthly” for Group E
Occupancies and replace it with the following:

Two fire drills per semester shall be conducted for a total of four fire drills
through the school year.

Exception: Child Day Care Centers shall conduct monthly fire drills.

Delete Section 501.4 - Timing of installation and replace it with the
following:

Section 501.4 ~ Timing of Installation. When fire apparatus access roads or
water supply for fire protection is required to be installed, such
protection shall be installed and made serviceable prior to occupancy
except when approved alternative methods of protection are provided.
Temporary street signs shall be installed at each intersection when
construction of new roadways allows passage by vehicles in accordance
with Section 505.2.

Add the following exceptions to Section 503.2.1 - Dimensions, as follows:

Exception:

1. Private fire lanes used exclusively as fire apparatus access roads may be
reduced to an unobstructed width of no less than 12 feet provided that



14.

15.

16.

17.

parking/operating pad(s) with a width of not less than 20 feet and a length of
not less than 30 feet are installed at the locations approved by the Code
Official.

2. For divided two-lane (one each way) public roadways the required
unobstructed width may be reduced to 17 foot curb back to curb back so
long as all of the following are met:

% No median and/or island or other obstruction may extend over 150
linear feet without an approved crossover.

% Outside curbs adjacent to the medians/islands or other obstructions
must be of a drive over/roll over design.

% Medians/islands or other obstructions may not exceed a saturation
limit of 25% of the entire project distance.

Add Section 503.2.1.1 - Residential Drives and Lanes, as follows:

Section 503.2.1.1 - Residential Drives and Lanes. For any dwelling that is set
back greater than 100 feet from the public way, the drive or lane shall have
an unobstructed width of not less than 10 feet and an unobstructed vertical
clearance of notless than 13 feet, 6 inches and shall comply with Section
503.2.3 Any drive or lane greater than 150 feet in length shall be
provided with a fire apparatus turnaround as approved by the Code
Official.

Delete Section 503.2.3 - Surface, and replace it with the following:
Section 503.2.3 - Surface. Fire apparatus access roads shall be hard
surfaced and shall be designed and maintained to support the imposed
loads of fire apparatus which shall be 100 pounds per square inch. The
load-bearing capacity shall be certified in a manner approved by the Code
Official.
Add a new Section 504.4, as follows:

Section 504.4 - Identification of Interior Doors. The Code Official may require
that certain interior doors be identified.

Delete Section 507.5.1 - Where required and replace it with the following:

Section 507.5.1 - Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or
building hereafter constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is
more than 300 feet from a hydrant on a fire apparatus access road, as
measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided where required
by the Code Official.

Exception:
1. For Group R-3, the distance requirement shall be 500 feet.

2. Forbuildings equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, the



18.

19.

20.

21.

2

23.

distance requirement shall be 600 feet.

Delete Section 603.4.2.1.2 - Clearance to Building and replace it with the
following:

Section 603.4.2.1.2 - Clearance to building. Portable outdoor gas-fired
heating appliances shall be located at least 10 feet from building or per
manufacturer recommendations which must be provided.

Delete Section 603.4.2.1.3 - Clearance to combustible materials and replace it
with the following:

Section 603.4.2.1.3 - Clearance to combustible materials. Portable outdoor
gas- fired heating appliances shall not be located beneath, or closer than
10 feet to combustible decorations and combustible overhangs, awnings,
sunshades or similar combustible attachments to building.

Delete Section 603.4.2.1.4 - Proximity to exits and replace it with the
following:

Section 603.4.2.1.4 - Proximity to exits. Portable outdoor gas-fired heating
appliances shall not be located within 10 feet of exits or exit discharges.

Delete Section 604.6.1 - Activation test and replace it with the following:

Section 604.6.1 - Activation test. An activation test of the emergency
lighting equipment shall be completed quarterly. The activation test shall
ensure the emergency lighting activates automatically upon normal
electrical disconnect and stays sufficiently illuminated for a minimum of 30
seconds.

Delete Table 609.3.3.1 - Commercial Cooking System Inspection Frequency and

replace it with the following:

Table 609.3.3.1 - Commercial Cooking System Inspection Frequency.

1. Low-volume cooking operations such as places of religious worship,
seasonal businesses and non-residential senior centers shall be inspected
by qualified persons every 12 months.

2. All other cooking operations must be inspected by qualified persons
every 6 months.

Delete Section 807.5.2.1 and 807.5.5.1 - Storage in corridors and lobbies and
replace it with the following:

Section 807.5.2.1 and 807.5.5.1 - Storage in corridors and lobbies. Clothing
and personal effects shall not be stored in corridors or lobbies.

Exception:

1. Storage in metal lockers provided the minimum required egress
width is maintained.

2. Corridors protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.



24,

25,

26.

27
28.
29.

Add Section 901.2.2 - Qualifications, as follows:

Section 901.2.2 - Qualifications. For the installation, inspection and
maintenance of water-based fire protection systems and fire alarm systems
a contractor must be certified by the State Fire Marshal’s Office. When
required by the Code Official, the contractor must provide a copy of their
certificate.

Delete Section 907.2.9 - Group R-2 and replace it with the following:

Section 907.2.9 - Group R-2. An automatic fire alarm system shall be installed
in Group R-2 occupancies where:

1. Any dwelling unit is located three or more stories above the lowest level of
exit discharge;

2. Any dwelling unit is located more than one story below the highest level of
exit discharge of exits serving the dwelling unit;

3. The building contains 12 or more dwelling units; or

4. Any dwelling unit is more than one story above any other dwelling unit in
the same building.

Exceptions:

1. A fire alarm system is not required in buildings not over two stories in
height where all dwelling units and contiguous attic and crawl spaces are
separated from each other and public or common areas by at least 1-hour
fire partitions and each dwelling unit has an exit directly to a public way, exit
court or yard.

2. A separate fire alarm system is not required in buildings that are
equipped throughout with an approved, supervised automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or Section 903.3.1.2 and
which will automatically activate throughout the notification zones upon a
sprinkler water flow.

For purposes of this section, area separation walls shall not define separate
buildings.

Add Section 908.8 - Carbon monoxide alarms.

Section 908.8 - Carbon monoxide alarms. Existing buildings containing or
using liquid carbon monoxide shall provide a single station audible
carbon monoxide alarm for each habitable enclosed area that has
components of the operating system located within the room and/or
within the ceiling space of the room. Reference Section 5001.3.3.8.

Section 1010.1.9.3 - Locks and latches. Delete subparagraph 2.
Delete 1013.2 - Floor-level exit signs in Group R-1.
Delete Section 1015.8 - Window openings.



30.
31.

32.

33.

34.

35

36.

37.

38.

59.

40.

41.

Delete Exception 2 from Section 1029.14 - Seat stability.

Delete Section 2311.2.3.1 - Disposal of Liquids and replace it with the
following:

Section 2311.2.3.1 - Disposal of Liquids. Lubricating oil which has been
drained from motor vehicles shall not be dumped into sewers, streams or on
the ground, but shall be stored and handled as required for Class IlI-A
liquids in accordance with Chapter 57 until removed from the premises.

Add the following exception to Section 3103.12.6.1 - Exit sign illumination, as
follows:

1. Exit sign illumination is not required in a temporary membrane structure,
tent or canopy if it is not going to be occupied after dark.

Add following criteria to Section 3104.3 - Label as follows:

In lieu of a permanently affixed label on a temporary membrane structure,
tent or canopy, flame-resistance or fire retardant shall be documented and
certified by the manufacturer in an approved manner.

Add to Section 5702 Definitions for combustible liquids the following:
Used crankcase oils shall be classified as I1I-A combustible liquid.

Delete Section 5704.1 - General and replace it with the following:

Section 5704.1 - Storage of flammable and combustible liquids in
containers, cylinders and tanks shall be in accordance with this section,
applicable sections of Chapter 50 and rules and regulations promulgated by
the State Fire Marshal.

Add Footnote D to the Table 5704.3.4.1, as follows:

Footnote D. Maximum quantity of used crankcase oils shall be limited to
250 gallons. Ifthe building is equipped with an automatic sprinkler system the
quantity can be increased a maximum of 100%.

Amend Appendix D103 Fire Apparatus Access Roads by deleting 70 foot
diameter CUL-DE-SAC and 60 foot Hammerhead in Figure D103.1 and
leaving said blank.

Amend Appendix D103 Fire Apparatus Access Roads by changing the 96 foot
diameter CUL-DE-SAC in Figure D103.1 to 88 feet in diameter.

Amend Appendix D103 Fire Apparatus Access Roads by changing the 120 foot
Hammerhead to 90 foot Hammerhead in Figure D103.1.

Add to Appendix D107 One- or Two-Family Residential Developments
Exception 2 the following:

The Fire Code Official shall not exceed an allowance of over 100 dwelling units
in accordance with NFPA 1141 Chapter 5 Table 5.1.4.1.

Add to Appendix E102.1.3 for Combustible Liquids the following:



Note: Used crankcase oils shall be classified as III-A combustible liquid.

163.05 BOARD OF APPEALS.

1. General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the Fire Code Official relative to the application and
interpretation of this Code, there shall be and is hereby created a Board of Appeals,
consisting of the members of the Construction Codes Review Board as established
in City of Robins Code of Ordinances Section 30.05. The Fire Code Official or
designated representative shall be an ex-officio member without a vote and shall act
as secretary of the Board.

2. The Board shall adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its
investigations and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the Fire Code
Official with a duplicate copy to the appellant, and may recommend to the City
Council such new legislation as is consistent therewith. The Board shall hold a
regular meeting on the fourth Tuesday of each month, unless there are no
appeals or business on file for a hearing.

3. Nominal appeal fee to the Board of Appeals shall be paid as set forth by
resolution of the City Council. The appeal shall be valid for one (1) year from the
date of the Board approval to the commencement of work and to the completion of
work undertaken pursuant to the approval.

SECTION 2. That these pages as provided in the Ordinance shall be made a part of the
replacement pages of the Municipal Code, City of Robins, lowa.

SECTION 3. Effective Date. That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and
after its passage and publication as provided by law.

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS day of , 2022,

Chuck Hinz, Mayor
ATTEST:

Lori D. Pickart, City Clerk/Treasurer



ORDINANCE NO. 2212

ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 75 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES

RELATED TO UTILITY TERRAIN VEHICLES (UTVS)

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROBINS, IOWA:

Section 1. Chapter 75 of the Code of Ordinances is amended by deleting the same and inserting in lieu
thereof the following:

CHAPTER 75
ALL-TERRAIN VEHICLES, SNOWMOBILES AND OFF-ROAD UTILITY
VEHICLES
75.01 Purpose 75.06 Negligence
75.02 Definitions 75.07 Accident Reports
75.03 General Regulations 75.08 Exemptions
75.04 Places of Operation 75.09 Scheduled Offenses and Fines
75.05 Requirements for UTVs

75.01 PURPOSE. The purpose of this chapter is to regulate the operation of all-terrain vehicles,
snowmobiles, and off-road utility vehicles within the city.

75.02 DEFINITIONS. For use in this chapter the following terms are defined:

1.

“All-terrain vehicle” or “ATV” means a motorized flotation-tire vehicle with not less than three
(3) low pressure tires, but not more than six (6) low pressure tires, that is limited in engine
displacement to less than one thousand (1000) cubic centimeters and in total dry weight to less
than one thousand (1000) pounds and that has a seat or saddle designed to be straddled by the
operator and handlebars for steering control. Two-wheeled, off-road motorcycles as defined in
Section 3211.1 of the Code of Towa shall also be considered an all-terrain vehicle.

(Code of Iowa, Sec. 321L.1[1])

“Snowmobile” means a motorized vehicle weighing less than one thousand (1000) pounds which
uses sled-type runners or skis, endless belt-type tread, or any combination of runners, skis or
tread, and is designed for travel on snow or ice.

(Code of Iowa, Sect. 321G.1[18]

“Off-road utility vehicle” or “UTV” means a vehicle with not less than four and not more than
eight non-highway tires or rubberized tracks that have a seat that is of bucket or bench design, not

intended to be straddled by the operator, and a steering wheel or control levers for control.

"Off-road utility vehicle” include the following vehicles:




a. Type 1 is defined as an off-road utility vehicle with a total dry weight of one
thousand two hundred pounds (1200) or less with a width of 50 inches or less.

b. Type 2 is defined as an off-road utility vehicle, other than a Type 1 off-road
utility vehicle, with a total dry weight of two thousand (2,000) pounds or less and
width of 65 inches or less.

c. Type 3 is defined as an off-road utility vehicle with a total dry weight of more
than two thousand (2000) pounds or a width of more than 65 inches, or both.

(Code of Towa, Sec. 3211.1[17])

75.03 GENERAL REGULATIONS. No person shall operate an ATV, snowmobile, or UTV within the
City in violation of the provisions of Chapter 321G of the Code of Iowa or rules established by the
Natural Resource Commission of the Department of Natural Resources governing their registration,
numbering, equipment, and manner of operation.

75.04 PLACES OF OPERATION. The operators of ATVs, snowmobiles and UTVs shall comply with
the following restrictions as to where ATVs and snowmobiles may be operated within the City:

1.

Streets. ATVs and snowmobiles, shall be operated only upon streets which have not been plowed
during the snow season and on such other streets as may be designated by resolution of the
Council.

Code of Iowa, Sec. 321G.9[4a]

Properly equipped UTVs may be operated upon any city roadway with a speed limit of 35 miles
per hour or less. Roadways are defined as the portion of a highway improved, designed, or
ordinarily used for vehicular traffic. UTVs shall ONLY be driven on State two (2) lane highways
over the most direct and accessible route to and from an all-terrain vehicle park or trail, to the
nearest County (secondary) road, or an authorized city street or your residence.

Exceptions. ATVs, snowmobiles, and UTVs may be operated on prohibited streets only under the
following circumstances.

a. Emergencies. ATVs, snowmobiles, and UTVs may be operated on any street in an
emergency during the period of time when and at locations where snow upon: the
roadway renders travel by conventional motor vehicles impractical.

(Code of Towa, Sec. 321G.9[4])

b. Direct Crossing. ATVs, snowmobiles, and UTVs may make a direct crossing of a
prohlblted street prov1ded

i. The crossing is made at an angle of approximately ninety degrees to the direction
of the street and at a place where no obstruction prevents a quick and safe
crossing;

ii. The ATV, snowmobile, or UTV is brought to a complete stop before crossing the
street;

iii. The driver yields the right-of-way to all on-coming traffic which constitutes an
immediate hazard; and

iv. In crossing a divided street, the crossing is made only at an intersection of such
street with another street. '

(Code of Iowa, Sec. 321G.9{2]



Railroad Right-of-way. ATVs, snowmobiles, and UTVs shall not be operated on an operating
railroad right-of-way. An ATV, snowmobile, or UTV may be driven directly across a railroad
right-of-way only at an established crossing and notwithstanding any other provisions of law
may, if necessary, use the improved portion of the established crossing after yielding to all
oncoming traffic.

(Code of Towa, Sec. 321G.13[8]

Trails. ATVs and UTVs shall not be operated on snowmobile trails and snowmobiles shall not be
operated on ATV or UTV trails except where so designated.
(Code of Iowa, Sec. 321G.9[4f and g]

Parks and Other City Land. ATVs, snowmobiles and UTVs shall not be operated in any park, on
any trail, on any playground, or upon any other City-owned property without the express
permission of the City, with exception of the city roadways permitted by Section 75.04 above.
Additionally, UTVs being lawfully operated, may utilize city owned driveways, lanes, and
parking lots. Snowmobiles shall not be operated on any City land without a snow cover of at least
three (3) inches.

Sidewalk or Parking. ATVs, snowmobiles, and UTVs shall not be operated upon the public
sidewalk or that portion of the street located between the curb line and the sidewalk or property
line commonly referred to as the “the parking” except for purposes of crossing the same to a
public street upon which operation is authorized by this chapter.

Public Ice. ATVs, snowmobiles, and UTVs may not be operated upon any frozen creeks, streams,
ponds, or lakes within City limits. ATVs, snowmobiles and UTVs may not be operated in any
creek, stream, or river or in any portion of the creek bed, stream bed, or riverbed within City
limits.

75.05 REQUIREMENTS FOR UTVS. Operators of UTVs must adhere to the following equipment
requirements and restrictions while operating UTVs within the City limits.

1.

2.

Operators of UTVs within City limits must be 18 years of age or older and possess a valid
driver’s license.
A person shall not operate a UTV within the City limits unless the operator has proof of insurance
complying with that required of an operator of a motor vehicle pursuant to applicable provisions
of the Iowa Code, Rules and Regulations, including but not limited to Iowa Code Sections
321.20B and 321A.21.
Owners of UTVs, operated within City limits, shall register their UTV with the Jowa Department
of Natural Resources and proof of such registration shall be provided, upon request, to any peace
officer requesting it. Out-of-state UTV operators must provide appropriate proof of registration
from their home state upon request by any peace officer.
UTVs may only be operated on the roadways between the hours of 7 a.m. to 10 p.m.
Operators of UTVs must adhere to noise restrictions set forth under Robins Code Chapter 52.
UTVs must display lighted headlamps and tail lamps, at all times, while the vehicle is operated on
city streets or highways.
Operators of UTVs must adhere to all traffic and parking laws, codes, rules, and regulations,
applicable to other motor vehicles, unless directed otherwise by this ordinance.
UTVs must be equipped:

a. Operational turn signal lamps with a manually operated switch controlled by the driver.



b. Operational speedometer, calibrated in miles per hour, which is fully illuminated when
the head lamp(s) are activated.

c. Operational horn with a switch controlled by the driver.

d. Two operational head lamps and tail lamps must be affixed to each side on the front and
back of the UTV. Tail lamps shall be red and include a stop lamp actuated by pressing the
brake pedal. The use of lightbars, spotlights, or decorative lights is not permitted while
the UTV is being operated on city streets or highways.

e. Rear facing mirror providing the operator with a clear view of the rear.

f.  Operational muffler, in good working order, which complies with the standards and
procedures required by Iowa Code 3211.12 and Robins City Ordinance Chapter 52.

9. All occupants except as noted below, must wear safety belts or safety harnesses, which meet the
definition of a safety belt or safety harness set forth by Iowa Code 321.445, while the UTV is in
motion.

a. Children under 1 year old and weighing less than 20 pound must be secured in a rear-
facing child restraint system while the UTV is motion.

b. Children, ages 1-6 years, must be secured in a child restraint system (safety seat or
booster seat) while the UTV is in motion.

i. A child restraint system is a specially designed seating system, including a belt
positioning seat or booster seat which meets federal motor vehicle safety
standards. The child restraint system must be used in accordance with the
manufacturer’s instructions, the child must be secured in the child restraint, and
the child restraint must be properly secured to the UTV.

¢. No animals will be transported in the cargo portion or bed of a UTV unless they are
contained within an enclosure secured to the UTV.

10. UTV doors or nets must be closed during operation if so equipped.

11. The number of passengers in a UTV shall not exceed the number of factory-installed seats in the
UTV. '

12. No open containers of alcohol allowed while the UTV is being operated.

13. Drivers may not operate a UTV under the influence of intoxicating liquor or narcotics as
prescribed under Iowa Code 3211.

14. No UTV will be operated in a careless or reckless manner so as to; endanger any person; cause
injury or damage to person or property; create unnecessary skidding or sliding; or cause a wheel
or wheels to lose traction or contact with the ground. '

75.06 NEGLIGENCE. The owner and operator of an ATV, snowmobile, or UTV shall be liable for any
injury or damage occasioned by the negligent operation of the ATV, snowmobile, or UTV.
(Code of Towa, Sec 321G.18)

75.07 ACCIDENT REPORTS. Whenever an ATV, snowmobile, or UTV is involved in an accident
resulting in injury or death to anyone, or property damage amounting to one-thousand five hundred
dollars ($1,500), either the operator or someone acting on their behalf shall immediately notify a law
enforcement officer and shall file an accident report within forty-eight (48) hours in accordance with State
Law.

(Code of Iowa, Sec. 321G.10)

75.08 EXEMPTIONS. ATVs, snowmobiles, and UTVs owned by a government agency or subdivision
thereof, and used in an official capacity, and UTVs used exclusively to conduct agricultural purposes in
accordance with lowa Code Section 321.234A (1)(a) are exempt from registration and the requirements of
this ordinance.



75.09 SCHEDULED OFFENSES AND FINES. The following scheduled fines are fixed for violations
of the designated sections of this chapter.
1. For Violations of Chapter 75.04 (places of operation) sections (2), (6), (7), (8):
a. First offense $250
b. Second offense committed within one calendar year $500
c¢. Third and subsequent offenses committed within one calendar year $1,000
2. For Violation of Chapter 75.05 (requirements for UTVs) sections (4), (9), (10), (11), and (14):
a. First offense $250
b. Second offense committed within one calendar year $500
c¢. Third and subsequent offenses committed within one calendar year $1,000
3. For Violation of Chapter 75.05 (requirements for UTVs section (5):
a. Fines shall be in the amount set by Section 52.05 of this Code of Ordinances.

Section 2. That all other chapters shall remain unchanged by this ordinance.
Section 3. That all ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the same are hereby repealed.

Section 4. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, approval and
publication, as provided by law.

Passed and approved this day of , 2022,

Chuck Hinz, Mayor

ATTEST:

Lori Pickart, City Clerk/Treasurer



RESOLUTION NO. 1022-3

RESOLUTION AWARDING QUOTATION RELATING TO
SOLAR POWERED FLASHING STOP SIGNS

WHEREAS, quotations to purchase solar powered flashing stop signs have been
received from the following vendors:

Description: LED Lighting Solutions TAPCO
Four (4) Solar Powered Flashing $1,499.99 EA; total with $1,575.00 EA; total with
perimeter LED’s stop signs freight $6,095.39 freight $6,419.80

WHEREAS, the City Council has reviewed the above referred to quotations and finds
the quotation received from LED Lighting Solutions in the amount of $6,095.39 should be
approved.

NOW, THEREFORE, IT IS RESOLVED by the City Council, City of Robins, Iowa, that
said quotation is hereby approved by the City, and the Mayor and City Clerk are hereby
authorized and directed to execute said quotation on behalf of the City.

Passed and approved, this 314, day of October, 2022.

Chuck Hinz, Mayor
ATTEST:

Lori Pickart, City Clerk/Treasurer



LED Lighting Solutions

42410 Winchester Rd.
Temecula, California 92590
United States

BILLTO: .
City of Robins Police Department, |1A
2658 2ndSt.
:Robins, IA 52328

‘us

Sales Rep

e ke

~ EST04394
Doc Date: | 09/23/22

§HPTO:
:City of Robins Police Department, 1A
. Gary Manhart

265 S. 2nd St.
-Robins, 1A 52328

Us
¢
Gustomer PO 2 Expires On

' Description - UofM ~ UnitPrice  Ext.Price
Helios Series: R1-1 36" Solar Powered Flashing
HELIOS-R11XX-0036-  Perimeter LEDs "STOP" Sign - Diamond Grade
4 DMG-RLED-SL Reflective Sheeting - Includes: 12V Solar e Uit $5,999.96

_dunctionBox
Android Bluetooth Control Sol

Flashing C

Box - Single Flash w/ Dimmable Function -

4 SONTL-0037200-12/ 1, des; PCB, 15W/18Y Solar Panel, Battery Edch
5 _ (12V/7200mAH) - With Timer Control Work Mode
' Functions Size: 15" x 13.75" X 1.75"
Helios Series: R1-1 36" Solar Flashing Perimeter
4 HELIOS-R11XX-0036-) £ "vsTOP" Sign - Diamond Grade Reflective  Each

DMG-RLED

1 week lead time

UPS shipping quoted
Sales tax not applicable
Estimate good for 30 days

- ESTIMATES ARE GOOD FOR 30 DAYS -

Sheeting - Requires: 12V Junction Box

Subtotal | $5,999.96

Tax * $0.00
Frelght : $95.43 |
Discount : $0.00

Total | $6,005.39 .

Page 1 of 1



- TAPCO

Safe travels.

SALES QUOTE

Customer Copy

All prices are listed in US Dollars (USD)

For terms and conditions, please visit: bitps://www.tapconet.com/terms-conditions

Traffic and Parking Control Co., Inc. Q22015953
5100 West Brown Deer Road ]
Brown Deer, Wisconsin 53223 _ 3’23/2022
Phone (800) 236-0112 « TAPCOnet.com « Fax (800) 444-0331
Sell To Robins City ShipTo | Robins City
Coreos | Gary Manhart Gust | Gary Manhart
: 265 2nd St 265 2nd St
ROBINS, |A 52328 ROBINS, IA 52328
USA USA
Customer PO # Expires Sisp Terms Freight Ship Via
10/23/2022 |Alex Horaitis Net 30 DAYS PREPAY/ADD BEST RATE
2180-00209 Blinkersign, R1-1, 30", Stop, DG3, Red, Solar, 8 4 EA 1,575.00 $6,300.00
Red LEDSs, Single Post Mount
125656 Sign Mounting Kit, Wood Post, Anti-Vandal For 4 EA 29,95 $118.80
Mounting One Blinker Sign to 4"x6" Wood Post
Free freight with purchase
Thank you - Alex Horaitis
Thank you - Alex Horaitis
Email - Alex.Horaitis@tapconet.com
Mobile Number: (262) 893-1555
Shipment within Merchandise Freight Tax Total
Acceptance By :
Date $6,419.80 $0.00 $0.00 $6,419.80
By



RESOLUTION NO. 1022-4

RESOLUTION AWARDING QUOTATION RELATING TO
SPEED MONITORS

WHEREAS, quotations to purchase solar powered speed monitors have been received
from the following vendors:

Description: SETON MPH Industries

Two (2) post mounted Solar $3,985.00 EA; ) )
12,710. thout freight

Powered Speed Monitors $8,543.13 total with freight : e B RS

WHEREAS, the City Council has reviewed the above referred to quotations and finds
the quotation received from Seton in the amount of $8,543.12 should be approved.

NOW, THEREFORE, IT IS RESOLVED by the City Council, City of Robins, Iowa, that
said quotation is hereby approved by the City, and the Mayor and City Clerk are hereby
authorized and directed to execute said quotation on behalf of the City.

Passed and approved, this 3+4, day of October, 2022.

Chuck Hinz, Mayor
ATTEST:

Lori Pickart, City Clerk/Treasurer



Subject

Your Quoté: 26765930

From Ryan Stevens-<ryan_: ‘stevens@seton.com>
To <GARYuMANHART@CITYOFROBINS,ORG>
Date ’

reundcuos

FIRE 8 EMERGENGY

PIFE MAKKERS

COVID-19 PRODUCTS

BAFETY SIGHS TRAFFIC-& PARKING ASSET 1D
FAST SHIFPING

QUOTATION NUMBER QUOTE VALID O

| 26765930 '09r11/2022

CUSTOMER REFERENCE NUMBER

Your account number 10R7513911
Quote Prepared

OITY OF ROBINS: POL!OE DEPARTMENT
265 $ 2NDST

ROBINS |A 52328-9762.

BINS POLICE:DEPARTMENT

265

2ND §
ROBINS A 52328-9752

Dgar Captain Manhart,
valid until 09/11/2022, Please review and contact me directly to pl

any furthef questions.

| look forward to. working with, you,
Ry" Slevéris

1-877-850:2155 gxt.
ryan_stévens@seton.com

Thank you far sltowihg Seton the opportunity te'earn your business. This quotation is

ace your-ordér of for

OROER NOW
{TERM NUMBER _s} DESCRIPTION QUANTITY uoM NET PRICE Ex:gf‘c%“
Liné Number: oooo1o 3 EA 8,085.00 7,9_"7'0".‘6‘0'
1
812/22, 2:57PM Roundaube Webmall-& Your Qiioté: 26765930
Tax: 478,20 l
| Quote Total: 8,543.13 ‘

ohop All Seton

Produets




MPH Industries, Inc.
316 East 9th Street
Owensboro KY 42303
Phone: 888-689-9222
Fax: 270-685-6288

Date: 9/28/2022
Expires: 11/27/2022
Reference:

AV 4| o

Terms: NET 30 DAYS

Sales Person: Brandy Atherton
Phone: 888-689-9222

“ QUOTE: 34403

Fax: 270-685-6288
Email: bmatherton@mphindustries.com

INDUSTRIES

Quote To:
265 SOUTH 2ND STREET
ROBINS IA 52328 USA
Phone: 319-393-8683 Fax:
Email:
Customer #: 523281

ROBINS POLICE DEPARTMENT

ROBINS, |A 52328
USA

Email:
Ship Via: Best Way GND

Ship To: ROBINS POLICE DEPARTMENT
265 SOUTH 2ND STREET

Phone #: 319-393-8683 Fax #:

“*OPTIONS NOT INCLUDED IN BASE PACKAGE PRICING**

UsD
LinewPart Description Rev
1 SMF-AC Speed Monitor F speed display with two- -
digit speed display, AC power option,
pole mounting bracket, tuning fork, and
) manual
e Kit Components --—-—-—==—=
Kit Seq. Part Number Description Qty Per
1.001 991037 MANUAL,SPEED PATROL 1 EA
1.002 991035 MONITOR,"F",SPEED 1 EA
1.003  990623B DISPLAY ASSY,SMD,18",2 1 EA
1.004 910828 RADAR,DRU3 W/CABLE 1 EA
1.005 903389 FORK, TUNING,35MPH K 1 EA
1.006 950761 SWITCH ASSY,PWR,SPD 1 EA
1.007 950782 POWER SUPPLY 1 EA
Quantity 2 EA Unit Price 4,425.00 Ext Price:  8,850.00
Part Description Rev
909742 12V/24HR TIMER ND
**OPTIONAL** |
Quantity 0 EA Unit Price 82.00 Ext Price:
Line% Part™ " Description Rev
10 951770 SPEEDVIEW TRAFFIC ANALYSIS -
COMPUTER
\**OPTIONAL** |
Quantity 0 EA Unit Price 833.00 Ext Price:
Description Rev
UPGRADE TO SOLAR POWER ND
SUPPLY
*OPTIONAL** |
Quantity 2 EA Unit Price 1,930.00 Ext Price:  3,860.00
Linel  Part Description Rev
12 951459RB RED/BLUE FLASHING STROBES ND
Quantity 0 EA Unit Price 400.00 Ext Price:
tl-: =§E§éﬂ / DBSCﬁpﬁOﬂ Rev
951783G01 BLUETOOTH OPTION ND
Quantity 0 EA Unit Price 150.00 Ext Price:
QuotForm: SDH-PROD:Ver1.4 (2021-08-05) For detail Terms of Sale, please go to http://mpdinc.com/cos.htm Page: 1of2




MPH Industries, Inc. Date: 9/28/2022

316 East oth Street Expires: 11/27/2022 IM —i
Owensboro KY 42303 -

Reference:
Phone: 888-689-9222 Terms: NET 30 DAYS INDUSTRIES
Fax: 270-632-6768 Sales Person: Brandy Atherton
— Phone: 888-689-9222
L% QUOTE: 34403 Fax: 270-685-6288

Email: bmatherton@mphindustries.com

Line ™~ Parf s TRt RERTELRE i -1 . Degcription Rev
14 55000 $0 Shipping per contract
Quantity 2 EA Unit Price Ext Price:

Total: 12,710.00
Plus shipping and any applicable taxes

Thank you for an opportunity fo quote.

.............................

QuotForm: SDH-PROD:Ver1.4 (2021-08-05) For detail Terms of Sale, please go to http://mpdinc.com/cos.htm Page: 20f2



